Kester, Tony

‘Julia Foster' <JuliaFoster@scstatehouse.gov>

Debbie Hammond <DebbieHammond@scstatehouse.gov>
7/10/2013 2:02:36 PM

RE: Dem party

Very good. We could not find a payment in June and had expanded the search.

From: Julia Foster [mailto:JuliaFoster@scstatehouse.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2013 1:20 PM

To: Debbie Hammond; Kester, Tony

Subject: FW: Dem party

FYI-

Cathy spoke with a representative at the party... Clerical error.
Mystery solved.

From: Hazelwood, Cathy [mailto:Cathy@ethics.sc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2013 12:13 PM

To: Julia Foster

Subject: Dem party

It was suppose to be the “State Election Commission reimbursement of filing fees” after all those candidates were
kicked off the ballot. They are going to amend the report. Can we say SLOPPY!

Cathy
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