
From: Lowder, Joe <JLowder@dew.sc.gov>
To: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov

Date: 11/26/2012 8:45:20 AM
Subject: RE: FAQ

Katherine - hope you had a great Thanksgiving weekend. Let me know what you need from us on our 
end about the letters or FAQs. We are standing by to get them signed and over to DSIT for printing 
and distribution. Thanks.

Joe

-----Original Message-----
From: Lowder, Joe
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2012 1:59 PM
To: Veldran, Katherine
Subject: RE: FAQ

Katherine - this is the final version of the FAQs that we have cleaned up. Please discard your other
copy. I have deleted the Definitions and Terms portion as well as the wording to recommend deleting 
question 16. We thought question 16 emphasized a negative message. If reimbursables decide to not 
pay the charges - we will have to initiate collection efforts. While I have kept the question in on this
version - we recommend the question be removed. We were not able to come up with a viable
solution regarding the interest question.

Joe

-----Original Message-----
From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2012 1:19 PM
To: Lowder, Joe
Subject: Re: FAQ

Sounds good. Were we able to come up with the solution regarding interest?

-----Original Message -----
From: Lowder, Joe [mailto:JLowder@dew.sc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2012 01:17 PM
To: Veldran, Katherine
Subject: Re: FAQ

Tried to call - have a few minor changes to what I sent you earlier. Can re-send it in 5 mins. No 
significant changes.

-----Original Message -----
From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2012 01:08 PM
To: Lowder, Joe
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Subject: FAQ

Are there any update about the FAQs? We have minor edits to the letters. 
Thank you, Katherine


