
From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Anderson, Gary <Gary.Anderson@admin.sc.gov>

Rochester, Renee <Renee.Rochester@admin.sc.gov>
CC: Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>

Casserly, James <James.Casserly@admin.sc.gov>
Date: 11/3/2015 4:37:39 PM

Subject: RE: Vice News - FOIA check

Thank you, Gary.
 
Renee – Please let us know as soon as you can this afternoon.  Thank you!
 
From: Anderson, Gary 

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2015 4:23 PM

To: Rochester, Renee

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Schimsa, Rebecca; Casserly, James

Subject: RE: Vice News - FOIA check
 
Renee,
 
Have you seen a check come in for the amount shown below.
 
We have not seen it and I am unaware where he would have mailed it to.
 
Thank you,
 
Gary
 
From: Casserly, James 

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2015 3:24 PM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca; Anderson, Gary

Cc: Pisarik, Holly

Subject: RE: Vice News - FOIA check
 
Rebecca,
 
Checked IQ and his name doesn’t show up at all I even queried the FOIA selection.  The request must not be in there 
either.  I would definitely remember seeing a check that big.  It hasn’t come over here. 
 
Jim Casserly
Director, Ombudsman
Office of Executive Policy and Programs

The South Carolina 
Department of Administration
1200 Senate Street, Suite 104, Columbia, SC 29201
(803) 734-7215

Note: Act 121 of 2014 (SC Restructuring Act of 2014) abolished the Budget and Control Board. Effective July 1, 2015, the Office of 
Executive Policy and Programs has been transferred to the Department of Administration. Please update your contact information.
 
 
From: Schimsa, Rebecca 

Sent: Tuesday, November 03, 2015 3:16 PM

To: Anderson, Gary; Casserly, James


mailto:Schimsa,%20Rebecca%20%3CRebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov%3E
mailto:Gary.Anderson@admin.sc.gov
mailto:Renee.Rochester@admin.sc.gov
mailto:HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
mailto:James.Casserly@admin.sc.gov


Cc: Pisarik, Holly

Subject: Vice News - FOIA check

 
Gary and Jim,
 
Jason Leopold with Vice News said he mailed in a check for $1,575.00 to pay for a FOIA request for records relating to 
the Confederate Flag and the other Emmanuel shooting.  I have no record of receiving this check.  Would you please 
check your files to see if we have received this check?
 
Thank you,
 
Rebecca
 
 
 
Rebecca S. Schimsa
Deputy Legal Counsel
Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
O: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561
 


