4/25/2016 9:04:06 AM
Fwd: Outstanding Invoice--Third Request

Hi Tony and Holly, as of today, | still have not received payment of this outstanding invoice from
January. Please advise!

Sent from my iPad

Begin forwarded message:

From: Justice Corrigan < >
Date: March 21, 2016 at 12:11:06 PM EDT

To: "Catone, Tony" < >
Subject: Re: Outstanding Invoice

Thanks, Tony. Will note for any future billings.

Sent from my iPhone

| On Mar 21, 2016, at 11:31 AM, Catone, Tony < > wrote:

Of course. We were actually just dealing with that recently. Our finance department
appears to have difficulty with the "split" between us and the Governor's office. In the
future, it might be good if you notate on the invoice that DSS is responsible for half and
Governor is responsible for half, and send it to me and to Holly Pisarik. You don't have to
do that, but I think it will help get it processed faster.

| Thank you for your service and we'll try to get this resolved right away.
| Tony
| Anthony S. H. Catone

| General Counsel

| South Carolina Department of Social Services
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Office of General Counsel
P.O. Box 1520

Columbia, SC 29202-1520

Office Phone: (803) 898-7368
Fax: 803-898-7245

Email;

Privacy Notice: This message may contain information that is protected from disclosure by
federal and/or state law, or is otherwise privileged or confidential. This communication is
intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not
the intended recipient or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this message to
the recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, or copying of this
message is strictly prohibited and violations of applicable federal and/or state law may
subject you to civil and/or criminal penalties. If you have received this message in error,
please notify the sender immediately by telephone and delete this message.

From: Justice Corrigan [ ]
Sent: Monday, March 21, 2016 8:54 AM
To: Catone, Tony < >

Subject: Outstanding Invoice

Hi Tony, | am hoping you can help me find out what happened to the invoice | sent to you in
late January? Can you please let me know where this is in the payment process? Thanks
very much in advance.

Sent from my iPad
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