
From: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
To: Catherine McNicollCatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 8/17/2017 9:41:15 AM
Subject: Fw: Campaign Reimbursement

Sent using OWA for iPhone 

From: Dickey, Courtney M. 
Sent: Thursday, August 17, 2017 9:00:48 AM
 
To: Danny Varat
 
Subject: Campaign Reimbursement 
 
Good Morning.
 
  I work at the S.C. Department of Public Safety and we have an invoice for the 2nd Quarter campaign for Lt. Governor 
Bryant in the amount of $1.07 that needs to be paid.
I would like to mail the invoice, but I need contact information so that I can create a customer number in SCEIS.
 
The information that I need is the correct address, contact person and phone number.
 
If you have any questions, please contact me at 803-896-5211.
 
Thank you
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