From: Sarah Smith <MemberServices@wexfordplantation.com>
To: Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
Amanda Schultzaschultz@wexfordplantation.com
Date:  3/18/2014 11:03:31 AM
Subject:  FW: Updated Invoices for Discussion
Attachments:  Sarah Smith P16 2.pdf

| just got off the phone with the representative from the Drinkware Company. She told me that there is NO guarantee
that the tree will be filled this year - similar to last year's situation. She did send the attached proof in which she
enlarged the tree to try and avoid the error....she still said there was no guarantee. Let me know your thoughts. |
could always research another company that would hopefully be able to print what we need.

Sarah Smith

Member Services

(843) 686-8810 ext 114

PO Box 4100

Hilton Head Island, SC 29938

Twitter: WexfordHHI
memberservices@wexfordplantation.com
Wexford Plantation Homeowners Association

From: Jennifer Grubb [mailto:jgrubb@printwand.com]
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2014 10:55 AM

To: Sarah Smith

Subject: Re: Updated Invoices for Discussion

jgrubb@printwand.com

Printwand

3297 Orchard Lake Road, Suite 201,
Keego Harbor, Michigan 48320 USA
248-738-7225

Dir: 248-630-4312

FAX: 248-883-8880

From: Sarah Smith <MemberServices@wexfordplantation.com>
Date: Tue, 18 Mar 2014 10:43:04 -0400

To: Microsoft Office User <jgrubb@drinkwarecompany.com>
Subject: FW: Updated Invoices for Discussion

Hey there Jennifer. Hope all is well. Please find the two logos attached. Would you mind giving me a call at some
point today to discuss the cups situation? Thanks again!

Sarah Smith
Member Services
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(843) 686-8810 ext 114
PO Box 4100

Hilton Head Island, SC 29938

Twitter: WexfordHHI
memberservices@wexfordplantation.com
Wexford Plantation Homeowners Association

From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, March 18, 2014 10:10 AM

To: Amanda Schultz; Sarah Smith

Subject: RE: Updated Invoices for Discussion

Let's discuss on the call.
KV
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