From: Taylor, Richele
To: Butch Bowers <Butch@ButchBowers.com>
Date:  10/21/2016 3:45:17 PM
Subject:  RE: Governor's Campaign Aug- Sept 2016

Yes — How about Tuesday? | am open. We can circle the wagons.

Richele

From: Butch Bowers [mailto:Butch@ButchBowers.com]
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2016 1:55 PM

To: Taylor, Richele

Subject: RE: Governor's Campaign Aug- Sept 2016

Thanks Richele. Do you want to set up a time to meet to finalize this next week? Let me know what works for you.
Thanks,

Butch

From: Taylor, Richele [mailto:RicheleTaylor@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Friday, October 21, 2016 12:34 PM

To: Butch Bowers <Butch@ButchBowers.com>

Subject: FW: Governor's Campaign Aug- Sept 2016

Butch,

Going back to our discussion pre-hurricane, we need to get back with the Governor. Obviously the major events
slated for that week didn’t occur, so we can get ahead again of these events and confirm how to pay. Attached is the
third quarter reimbursement. | need to go back and asked for OT because they waived that. However, right now we
are looking at $28.74. With elections ending in November, | don’t forsee a huge issue. However, there will still be a
couple of events, and there can be minor election events in the future. | am going to request they add the OT, per the
MOA, and then send the revised totals to you. (2.5 hoursis all).

Also, | will recap our discussion points and send those so we can move forward.

Thanks
Richele

From: Thompson, Joyce [mailto:jthompson@sled.sc.gov]
Sent: Thursday, October 20, 2016 2:55 PM

To: Taylor, Richele

Subject: Governor's Campaign Aug- Sept 2016
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