
From: Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
To: Robert FaturechiRobert.Faturechi@propublica.org
CC: Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov

Adams, ChaneyChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov
Date: 1/29/2016 9:39:19 AM

Subject: Re: Cost Letter

Ok, thank you. Have a good weekend. 


On Jan 29, 2016, at 9:28 AM, Robert Faturechi <Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org> wrote:


Thanks. The check should arrive Monday. 


Robert Faturechi
Reporter, ProPublica
Desk: 917-512-0216
Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Schimsa, Rebecca [RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov]
 
Sent: Friday, January 29, 2016 9:23 AM
 
To: Robert Faturechi
 
Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney
 
Subject: Cost Letter
 

Please see attached.
 
 
 
Rebecca S. Schimsa
Deputy Legal Counsel
Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
O: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561
 
One SC Flood Relief Fund – www.onescfund.org
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