From: Melissa Tanner

Sent: 3/18/2016 11:30:14 AM

To: Haley, Nikki

Cc: Blackley, Hope; Williams, Tracy
Subject: RE: Jason Drake

| will get that to you as soon as | can.

Jason Attorney’s office was not aware that he had been served yet again. Jason
has called his attorney’s office so that they are aware as of 03/18/2015. Jason
does “not” owe $24,343.72 per that last court hearing. Please pull the court
transcripts. Whatever was recorded on that transcript is what needs to be
followed.

Tracy,

Please await to hear from Mr. Drake’s attorney on this matter, since he has
representation.

Sincerely,

Hope Blackley

Spartanburg County Clerk of Court

Physical Address:

Spartanburg County Judicial Center
180 Magnolia Street

Suite 511

Spartanburg, SC 29306



Mailing Address:
Post Office Box 3483

Spartanburg, SC 29304-3483

Office Telephone: 864-596-2591

Direct Line: 864-596-3428

From: Williams, Tracy [mailto:tmwilliams@spartanburgcounty.org]
Sent: Friday, March 18, 2016 11:14 AM

To: Melissa Tanner

Cc: Blackley, Hope

Subject: FW: Jason Drake

CAUTION: This Email is from an EXTERNAL source. Ensure you trust this
sender before clicking on any links or attachments.

Per our verbal conversation earlier, we need a copy of the filed Power of
Attorney with the Register of Deeds stamp to discuss the case with you further.

Thank you,

Tracy Williams

From: Melissa Tanner [<mailto:MTanner@ghs.org>]
Sent: Friday, March 18, 2016 11:02 AM




To: NikkiHaley@gov.sc.gov <mailto:NikkiHaley@gov.sc.gov>
Cc: Blackley, Hope; Williams, Tracy
Subject: RE: Jason Drake

Mrs. Haley:

Back in June/July of 2015. Jason appeared in court. It was stated that in the
court room that the child support was not to accrue any longer the other party
receives $222.00 for Child Support. That takes the place of the Child Support.

It is illegal to keep accruing child support on Jason. Per Tracy stated the Judge
back out of what he said, well this was not clarified and explain to Jason. They
are causing Jason a lot of stress. Jason is to the point he does not care
anymore.

The Judge stated that the $222.00 was to be the standing payment for child
support. The continuous was to be for the $13,000.00 balance, of which Jason
offered her $50.00 a month to and to add the minor child to insurance: Medical,
Dental, Vision, Life insurance and Cancer Policies, of which was declined.

Sign your warrant but when you come Jason up Spartanburg County and the
State need to be prepared to take care of him medically and if cannot you will be
in violation of his disability rights. As he requires around the clock care.

This is ridiculous!!! Jason is not trying to get out of paying child support, he
cannot pay.

Jason wants the court transcripts pulled from the last hearing on this case as
that should have recorded every word that was spoken in court. We have
extremely ethical issue if the Judge backed out of what was stated and Jason
was not notified or this was not clearly stated to Jason. Jason suffers from a
traumatic brain injury and spinal cord injury.



Tracy: If you do not mind Please do not be hateful and rude to Jason Drake
when you call him as he is a Human being as well. Jason’s attendant care
witnessed the phone conversation her name Miss Windy and she was also in the
court room at the last hearing and heard every word that was stated. She
confirmed that your extremely hateful and rude to Jason. Jason suffers from a
traumatic brain injury and spinal cord injury. He does not need to be treated
that way be you or anyone else.

Sincerely,

Melissa Tanner
(864)454-0820
(864)201-5984

(864)559-0794-Jason Drake’s cell number

From: Melissa Tanner

Sent: Thursday, March 17, 2016 4:59 PM
To: 'Williams, Tracy'

Cc: 'Blackley, Hope'

Subject: RE: Jason Drake

Importance: High

Tracy: Jason was served papers today. On that paper work it states that Jason
currently owes $24,343.72 with a court date for April. What | do not understand
is his child support was supposed to stop accruing from the date of his last child
support hearing and he was also to be credited on the balance at that time
back to February when the other party started drawing the $222.00 social
security check for the minor child.



If the other party has a DSS case and is still drawing an FI(Family
independence)check then your office needs to communicate to DSS that Jason
no longer is accruing child support payments. The $222.00 is her child support
as the Judge stated. It is not Jason’s responsibly to make sure the Judge’s
order is followed and communicated to DSS. Also Jason has made contact with
his attorney to let him know what is going on. This issue needs to get corrected
quickly.

On the back Child Support we made an offer for Jason to $50.00 a month on that
balance that was listed on the paper work we received when we left the court
house and to add the minor child to all of my insurance. Medical, Dental, Vision,
Life insurance and Cancer Policies. That offer was “not” accepted by other
party. Jason’s attorney is supposed to be scheduling a mediation in
Spartanburg County and/or a final hearing. It was scheduled in Greenville,
however don’t have a way to transport him out of the county. Jason would
either need to do the mediation in Spartanburg County or have final hearing with
a judge. | will scan and email you a copy of the offer we made that Jason’s
attorney also sent to the other party. The other party declined the offer that is
why the mediation was set, but we don’t have a way to transport him for
mediation in anther county(Greenville).

| have attached is a copy of the power of attorney.

| appreciate your help.

Thank You,

Melissa Tanner

{864}454-0820



