From: Soura, Christian
To: Earley, Jimmy <jearley@cio.sc.gov>
Date:  12/4/2013 3:52:03 PM
Subject:  RE: Additional information on decision packages 739 and 1798

Thanks. I hit send on the other email just as this one came in. If you wanna call whenever you have a
minute, we can probably step through these pretty quickly. Thanks.

CLS

Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff

(803) 543-0792
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov

From: Earley, Jimmy

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2013 3:46 PM

To: Soura, Christian

Subject: RE: Additional information on decision packages 739 and 1798

Looks OK at first glance. | agree that they will need to request funds to connect their county users to their network
using our VPN/2factor solution. We told the agencies that we would fund access for agency users, but could not
fund access for their county/third party folks.

They probably do need a CISO at the agency, given the data they maintain/share with the counties.
Thanks,

Jimmy

From: Soura, Christian

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2013 2:38 PM

To: Earley, Jimmy

Subject: FW: Additional information on decision packages 739 and 1798

Additional detail on the Election Commission’s IT requests for the upcoming FY. FYI.

CLS

Christian L. Soura
Deputy Chief of Staff

(803) 543-0792
ChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov

From: Baker, Josh

Sent: Wednesday, December 04, 2013 1:45 PM

To: Soura, Christian

Subject: FW: Additional information on decision packages 739 and 1798

Sending this to you so you can work; I'll break it down in the email response.
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idb

From: Reynolds, Janet

Sent: Tuesday, December 03, 2013 7:30 PM

To: Baker, Josh

Cc: Andino, Marci

Subject: Additional information on decision packages 739 and 1798

Attached is the additional information you requested. Please let me know if you need any additional information.

Janet Reynolds
Director of Administration and Finance

State Election Commission
P O Box 5987

Columbia, SC 29250
(803) 734-9069 (P)

(803) 734-9366 (F)



