
From: Taylor, Richele
To: Thompson, Joyce <jthompson@sled.sc.gov>

Date: 12/28/2016 4:34:58 PM
Subject: RE: 4th qtr campaign reimbursement

Thanks Joyce! I have asked for confirmation on this and the third quarter to make sure they are paid.  Will let you 
know when I receive confirmation.
 
Richele
 
 
Richele K. Taylor
Chief Legal Counsel
Office of the Governor
O:  803-734-8465
C:  803-231-9763
 
From: Thompson, Joyce [mailto:jthompson@sled.sc.gov] 

Sent: Wednesday, December 28, 2016 3:59 PM

To: Taylor, Richele <RicheleTaylor@gov.sc.gov>

Subject: 4th qtr campaign reimbursement
 
Here’s another invoice.  Thanks
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