
From: Taylor, Richele
To: CPCU Athena S. Christensen (achristensen@irf.sc.gov) <achristensen@irf.sc.gov>

Date: 9/15/2016 5:15:11 PM
Subject: RE: Insurance - Governor's Office

Athena,
 
One follow up question on our policies….For our T111110001A policy for coverage of legal issues outside of the IRF 
Tort policy, we pay $23,500 for $250,000 in coverage.  We could pay $8,500 for a $100,000 policy.  What would be 
the cost for a $150,000 policy?  Or even a $200,000 policy? Just looking at options.
 
Richele
 
 
Richele K. Taylor
Chief Legal Counsel
Office of the Governor
O:  803-734-8465
C:  803-231-9763
It’s a great day in South Carolina
 
Safe Place SC – www.safeplaceSC.sc.gov
 
 
 
From: Taylor, Richele 

Sent: Monday, September 12, 2016 1:28 PM

To: CPCU Athena S. Christensen (achristensen@irf.sc.gov)

Subject: Insurance - Governor's Office
 
Athena,
 
Just wanted to check in…I have located our items. General Services’ policy covers the Statehouse with a large general 
policy and an itemized one for artifacts.  They also have a similar policy for the Mansion.  I am meeting with them 
Friday to reassess and review our artifacts.
 
I have worked on our interior items.
 
Hope to have everything sorted out by Friday.
 
Thanks,
 
Richele
 
Richele K. Taylor
Chief Legal Counsel
Office of the Governor
O:  803-734-8465
C:  803-231-9763
It’s a great day in South Carolina
 
Safe Place SC – www.safeplaceSC.sc.gov
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