Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov>

Godfrey, Rob <RobGodfrey@gov.sc.gov>
11/6/2015 10:10:28 AM

RE: FOIA Update on Flag/Shooting

We mailed Andy’s revised cost letter on the 29th, so he should have received it.

From: Pisarik, Holly

Sent: Thursday, November 05, 2015 10:02 PM
To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Godfrey, Rob

Subject: Re: FOIA Update on Flag/Shooting

Andy is waiting on our revised cost letter. | talked to Seanna again today. She was supposed to discuss with her boss
today and let us know.

Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 5, 2015, at 6:20 PM, "Schimsa, Rebecca" <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Below is an update on Confederate Flag / Mother Emmanuel FOIA Requests. In order to produce the in-
state records at the same time, it would be helpful to check in with Andy and Seanna — since we have
received P&C’s and will need to process soon.

In-State Requests:

Glenn Smith, Post & Courier — Received payment: This week, Cynthia Roldan dropped of a check
for $14.80, the estimated cost. We will now begin compiling records.

Andy Shain, The State — Awaiting payment: A revised cost letter was mailed on October 29th
with an estimated cost of $166.70 of which a deposit of $100.00 is required before compiling
records.

Seanna Adcox, AP — Awaiting revised request: Holly talked to Seanna this week.
Out-of-State Requests:

Jason Leopold, Vice News — Uncertain: Leopold says he’s submitted the check in early October
for the full amount, an estimated cost of $1,575.00, but | have no record of it. Jim Casserly has
no record of the check in IQ. Awaiting response from Gary Anderson. Will confirm tomorrow
and then let Leopold know.

Rebecca S. Schimsa

Deputy Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
0: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561
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