
From: Nirav Shah <nshah@socialfinanceus.org>
To: Jan PolattyPOLATTYJ@scdhhs.gov
CC: Anthony KeckKECK@scdhhs.gov

Soura, ChristianChristianSoura@gov.sc.gov
John SupraSUPRA@scdhhs.gov
Erica BrownErica.Brown@scdhhs.gov
<tpalandjian@socialfinanceus.org> (tpalandjian@socialfinanceus.org)tpalandjian@socialfinanceus.org
Jay Smithjay.smith@scdhhs.gov
Brenda JamesJAMESBR@scdhhs.gov

Date: 8/14/2013 1:31:09 PM
Subject: Re: Call w/Social Finance, Inc.

Please use the following dial in number. Speak very soon. 

 Conference Dial-in Number: (530) 881-1000
 Participant Access Code: 847401#

On Wed, Aug 14, 2013 at 12:31 PM, Nirav Shah <nshah@socialfinanceus.org> wrote:

Good Afternoon,

We are looking forward to our 1:15pm call. Please find the attached deck to help guide our 
discussion.

Best,
Nirav

-- 

Nirav Shah
Director | Social Finance, Inc.  
W: 617.939.9900 x 23 | C: 202.615.8988
 

On Tue, Aug 13, 2013 at 11:41 AM, Jan Polatty <POLATTYJ@scdhhs.gov> wrote:

Resending to confirm call and provide call information: 
 
1-800-753-1965  passcode 8982766
 
Thanks, Jan.
 

Confidentiality Note

This message is intended for the use of the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
information, including health information, that is privileged, confidential, and the disclosure of which is 
governed by applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or the employee or 
agent responsible to deliver it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, 
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distribution or copying of this information is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. 
 

If you have received this in error, please notify us immediately and destroy the related message.

-- 

Nirav Shah
Director | Social Finance, Inc.  
W: 617.939.9900 x 23 | C: 202.615.8988
 
Mobilizing Investment Capital To Drive Social Change
www.socialfinanceUS.org
 
This email is prepared by Social Finance. It is for your information only and is not an offer or solicitation for the purchase or
sale of any security or a recommendation or endorsement of any security or any issuer. Social Finance makes no
representation about the accuracy, completeness, or timeliness of this information. This email may contain information that is
proprietary or is otherwise confidential in nature for the use of the addressee(s). The dissemination, copying, unauthorized
use, or publication of content in this email that is marked proprietary or confidential is prohibited without the approval of
Social Finance.

http://www.socialfinanceus.org/

