From: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
To: Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov>
Date:  2/21/2017 1:42:15 PM
Subject:  RE: Sen. Bryant Constituent Request

Good Afternoon Danny,
We had discussed some language to address Mr. Bailey’s issue.
| have three suggestions:

One, the portion in parenthesis indicates where an option in the language:

Amend Section 9-1-1650 by adding “Lump sum payments may be paid before ninety days if the member presents
evidence demonstrating an extraordinary and immediate necessity of the funds, such as a family medical crisis, (at
the Board’s discretion or at the Director’s discretion.)”

-With the above option we may have to investigate whether this creates a right that must be given procedural due
process.

Two:

Amend Section 9-1-1650 by adding “ Lump sum payments may be paid sooner than ninety days where the member
can demonstrate a family medical emergency necessitating interstate travel. This need may be shown by a letter from
the out of state physician.”

-With this option the circumstances are more narrow and we have defined the necessary evidence which likely avoids
the need for an appeal process because there is no discretion.

Three:
Amend Section 9-1-1650 by changing the lower bound from ninety days to thirty days or another lower amount.

Best Regards,

Catherine McNicoll

Director of Legal & Legislative Affairs
Lieutenant Governor’s Office
CatherineMcNicoll@SCStatehouse.gov
803-734-5292 (phone)

From: Catherine McNicoll

Sent: Friday, February 10, 2017 1:45 PM

To: Danny Varat

Subject: RE: Sen. Bryant Constituent Request

Mr. Bailey can be reached at 864-225-4185 (home) or 846-844-6532 (cell)

From: Danny Varat

Sent: Friday, February 10, 2017 8:11 AM

To: Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scstatehouse.gov>
Subject: Fw: Sen. Bryant Constituent Request

Just checking stuff off. Done?
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From: Danny Varat

Sent: Monday, February 6, 2017 10:46 AM
To: Catherine McNicoll

Subject: Fw: Sen. Bryant Constituent Request

Please call this gentleman and let him know that PEBA cannot process his lump sum request prior to the 90
day period. The law simply won't allow it, according to PEBA. It's in 9-1-1650, unless he TERI's, in which case
it'sin 9-1-2210. Now, if you find out different details, then we can take another run at it.

From: Peggy G. Boykin <PBoykin@peba.sc.gov>
Sent: Monday, January 30, 2017 8:35 AM

To: Danny Varat

Subject: FW: Sen. Bryant Constituent Request

fyi

Peggy G. Boykin, CPA
Executive Director

(0) 803.734.8117 | PBoykin@peba.sc.gov
202 Arbor Lake Dr., Columbia, SC 29223
www.peba.sc.gov
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This communication, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential information,
legally privileged information and/or information that is protected from disclosure by applicable federal and/or state law. If you are not
the intended recipient(s), please contact the sender toll-free at 888.260.9430, and destroy all copies of the original message. Any
unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. Please note that this email does not create a contract with any person.
Applicable statutes and plan documents set out the terms and conditions of retirement and insurance benefits offered by the Public
Employee Benefit Authority.

From: Debbie Parker [mailto:DebbieParker@scsenate.gov]

Sent: Monday, January 23, 2017 12:26 PM

To: Peggy G. Boykin <PBoykin@peba.sc.gov>

Cc: 'kevin@kevinbryant.com' <kevin@kevinbryant.com>; Catherine McNicoll <CatherineMcNicoll@scsenate.gov>
Subject: Sen. Bryant Constituent Request

*This is an external email. Think before you click on any links.

Peggy,
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Sidney M. Bailey is retired from the Anderson County Sheriff's Department. He has asked for a
lump sum of his retirement and was told it would take 90 days. His wife has cancer and they
have been traveling to LA for her treatments. He wants to know if his request can be expedited.
His contact numbers are home - 864-225-4185, cell - 864-844-6532. | would appreciate an
update as you work with Mr. Bailey so that | can keep Sen. Bryant informed.

Please let me know if | can be of further assistance.
Many thanks,

Debbie

Debbie Parker

SC Senate General Committee
Senator Kevin L. Bryant, Chairman
803-212-6320, Fax 803-212-6027
debbieparker@scsenate.gov
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