
From: Kester, Tony
To: 'Marie Waller' <MarieWaller@scstatehouse.gov>
CC: Ellison, Ruchelle <rellison@aging.sc.gov>

Date: 12/12/2014 11:53:04 AM
Subject: RE: Allendale County Office on Aging

We will rework the paperwork and get new signatures, then process to Allendale County.

Tony Kester
Aging Director
South Carolina Lieutenant Governor's Office on Aging
1301 Gervais Street, Suite 350
Columbia, SC 29201
Phone 803-734-9910, Fax 803-734-9886
kester@aging.sc.gov

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This electronic email may contain information that is privileged, confidential, and/or otherwise protected from
disclosure to anyone other than its intended recipient(s). Any dissemination or use of this electronic mail or its contents by persons other than the 
intended recipient(s) is strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by reply email so 
that we may correct our internal records. Please then delete the original message.

From: Marie Waller [mailto:MarieWaller@scstatehouse.gov]
Sent: Friday, December 12, 2014 11:45 AM
To: Kester, Tony
Cc: Ellison, Ruchelle
Subject: FW: Allendale County Office on Aging

Tony, per Mary Beth Fields, they only have one payment left to make. Can we send the reimbursement for the trip 
as she suggested below? More than likely this will end up in their last payment any way, but that way there is no 
possibility of overpayment on the federal taxes, which would leave their money in limbo for a while.

Marie

From: Mary Beth Fields [mailto:mfields@lscog.org]
Sent: Friday, December 12, 2014 10:54 AM
To: Marie Waller
Cc: Lynnda Bassham; Connie Shade
Subject: RE: Allendale County Office on Aging

Marie,

Thank you for the email. This is an old problem (2011) that the Allendale County Office on Aging and
Allendale County have been working on. Allendale County has been in contact with the IRS and from our
understanding Allendale County is getting ready to make the final payment to the IRS, hopefully by the end of 
the year. In the meantime, it our suggestion that the LGOA pays Allendale County with a note it is for the 
Allendale County Office on Aging senior trip in November, who is now handling all finance for the Allendale 
County Office on Aging. The address for Allendale County is below:

Allendale County
PO Box 190
Allendale, SC 29810

Please let me know if you have any other questions. Thanks! Mary Beth

mailto:Kester,%20Tony
mailto:arieWaller@scstatehouse.gov
mailto:MarieWaller@scstatehouse.gov
mailto:rellison@aging.sc.gov
mailto:kester@aging.sc.gov
mailto:MarieWaller@scstatehouse.gov
mailto:mfields@lscog.org
mailto:mfields@lscog.org


Mary Beth Fields, CIRS-A
Lower Savannah Council of Governments
Area Agency on Aging/Aging, Disability and Transportation Resource Center
Aging and Disability Programs Manager
PO Box 850
Aiken, SC 29802
Tel: 803-649-7981
TF: 1-866-845-1550
Fax: 803-649-2248
mfields@lscog.org
www.adtrc.org
www.lscog.org

From: Marie Waller [mailto:MarieWaller@scstatehouse.gov]
Sent: Friday, December 12, 2014 10:31 AM
To: Mary Beth Fields
Subject: Allendale County Office on Aging

Mary Beth: The LGOA was finally preparing to cut a check to reimburse the Allendale group that visited the State
House. However, Ruchelle said that because Allendale is under a federal levy, the funds cannot be sent to Allendale. 

I am wondering what the levy is for, and how we can get this reimbursement to them. Can you give me some
information on this issue? Thanks for your help.

Marie Waller
Chief of Staff
Lieutenant Governor McGill's Office
(803) 734-2080
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