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| Jan Polatty - (Block) FW: FOI request . o Page 1|

From: "Blanche Ellis" <bellis@schmoyercpa.com>
To: <polattyj@scdhhs.gov> Wﬂﬂﬁ?@g

Date: 7/16/2007 10:25:57 AM : .

Subject; (Block) FW: FOI request JUL 16 2007

Thanks Jan for your help. Department of Health & Human Services
Blanche OFFICE OF THE DIREGTOR
From: Blanche Ellis [mailto:bellis@schmoyercpa.com] ’ zgm; ﬁﬁ ?or

Sent: Monday, July 16, 2007 10:16 AM

To: "Terry Schmoyer'; 'stensland@scDHHS.gov'
Cc: 'Gwendolyn Henderson'

Subject: FOI request

Mr. mﬁm:m_m:a_

I would like to respectfully request a copy of the following under FOI on
Mattie C Hall facility:

9/30/06 MCD cost report and related work papers (Please include everything
sent with cost report Grouper, Trial Balance, Historical Cost...)
10/01/06 MCD desk audit package.

Please bill our office for copy charges as needed.

Please let me know if you have any questions and thanks for your assistance
with this request.

Blanche Ellis, CPA

Gwen would you please call me when ready so | may pickup?

Thanks

Blanche Ellis, CPA

Schmoyer and Company, LLC
1330 Lady Street Suite 507
Columbia, SC 29201

Phone (803) 254-2050

Fax (803) 256-9080

JPG attachment type(s) blocked

This message contained attachments that have been blocked
by Guinevere. Please see your system administrator for
more details
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Return-path: <bellis@schmoyercpa.com>
Received: from hm-pop2.solinus.com ([66.18.18.34])
by gw.dhhs state.sc.us with ESMTP; Mon, 16 Jul 2007 10:25:25 -0400
Message-Id: <20070716142524.22305.17644@hm-pop2.solinus.com>
Return-Path: bellis@schmoyercpa.com ,
X-Envelope-From: bellis@schmoyercpa.com
X-Envelope-To: polattyj@scdhhs.gov-
Received: From nsc69.38.100-29.newsouth.net (69.38.100.29) by hm-pop2.solinus.com (HOSTMAIL) for
polattyj@scdhhs.gov; Mon, 16 Jul 2007 14:25:24 -0000 (GMT)
From: "Blanche Ellis" <bellis@schmoyercpa.com>
To: <polattyj@scdhhs.gov>
Subject: (Block) FW: FOI request
Date: Mon, 16 Jul 2007 10:27:03 -0400
MIME-Version: 1.0
Content-Type: text/plain; charset=US-ASCI|
X-Mailer: Microsoft Office Outlook, Build 11.0.6353
X-MIMEOLE: Produced By Microsoft MimeOLE V6.00.2900.3138
thread-index: Acetzti+HITuTSMGnSsOUB8x66xzD4wZ5BpXwAACYFoA=

Thanks Jan for your help.
Bianche

From: Blanche Ellis [mailto:bellis@schmoyercpa.com]
Sent: Monday, July 16, 2007 10:16 AM

To: "Terry Schmoyer’; 'stensland@scDHHS.gov'

Cc: 'Gwendolyn Henderson'

Subject: FOI request

Mr. Stensland,

I would like to respectfully request a copy of the following under FOI on

Mattie C Hall facility:

9/30/06 MCD cost report and related work papers (Please include everything

sent with cost report Grouper, Trial Balance, Historical Cost...)

10/01/06 MCD desk audit package. )

Please bill our office for copy charges as needed.

Please let me know if you have any questions and thanks for your assistance
with this request.

Blanche Ellis, CPA

Gwen would you please call me when ready so | may pickup?
Thanks

Blanche Ellis, CPA

Schmoyer and Company, LLC

1330 Lady Street Suite 507

Columbia, SC 29201




| Jan Polatty - Mime.822

Page 2 |

Phone (803) 254-2050

Fax (803)256-9080

JPG attachment type(s) blocked

This message contained attachments that have been blocked
by Guinevere. Please see your system administrator for

more details




State of South Caroling
Bepartment of Health ard Human Berbices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Governor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours $
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages $
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $_
Shipping and Handling Costs $
Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: $

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



State of South Garolina
Bepartment of Healtl and Hrrom Sertrices

Mark Sanford Susan B. Bowling
Govemnor Acting Director

July 30, 2007

Blanche Ellis
Schmoyer and Co.
1330 Lady Street
Columbia, SC 29210

Dear Ms. Ellis:

In response to your recent Freedom of Information Act request, enclosed you will find
the billing for processing the information you requested and pick-up from our office.

| hope this information is helpful to you. If you should have any questions, please
contact Brandy Putnam at (803) 898-1016.

Sincerely,
\ﬁN\N&! 2
William L. Wells, CPA

Deputy Director

WLW/bep
Enclosures

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



State of South Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Hunum Serfices

Mark Sanford Susan B. Bowling
Governor Acting Director
July 30, 2007
TO: Blanche Ellis
Schmoyer and Co..
FROM: William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request # 28

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour 1 Hours $10.00
Pages copied at $.10 per page 88 Pages $8.80
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $_
Shipping and Handling Costs $
Other costs associated with the FOIA request: __ $

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: E.

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Plgage contact Br. Putpam at (803) 898-1016 should you have any questions.
\gh\i ) 07/30/07

Signature ) Date

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
{(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



