
From: Bryant, Kevin <kevin@kevinbryant.com>
To: Danny VaratDannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov

Date: 10/10/2017 9:52:46 AM
Subject: Re: [Scan] 2017-09-03 07:25:59

alrighty

Sincerely,
Kevin
 

Kevin L. Bryant
 
Lieutenant Governor of South Carolina
104-A North Avenue
Anderson, South Carolina 29625
 
www.kevinbryant.com

On Tue, Oct 10, 2017 at 9:02 AM, Danny Varat <DannyVarat@scstatehouse.gov> wrote:

​The short answer to this is no


From: Kevin Bryant <kevin@kevinbryant.com>
 
Sent: Sunday, September 3, 2017 7:26 AM
 
To: Lily Cogdill; Danny Varat
 
Subject: [Scan] 2017-09-03 07:25:59 
 
Does this count for reimbursement?
 
--
 
Sent with Genius Scan (+) for iOS.
 
http://dl.tglapp.com/genius-scan
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