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" Linda Malone - Am_om& FOIl Request :

From: "Terry Schmoyer" <tschmoyer@schmoyercpa.com>
To: <stensland@scDHHS.gov>

Date: 3/22/2007 7:36:20 PM

Subject: {Block) FOI Request

Mr Stendsland

| would like to respectful request a copy of the 9/30/06 Medicaid cost
report for Peachtree Center. Would you please send me a copy of all work
papers submitted with this report?

Please bill me for copy charges as needed.

Thanks for your assistance with this request.=20

Terry

=20

Terry K. Schmoyer, Jr. CPA
Managing Partner

=20

=20

=20

1330 Lady Street Suite 507
Columbia, SC 29201
Phone (803) 254-2050

Fax (803)256-5080

Cell (803) 920-0038
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RECEIVE]
- MAR ¢ 3 2007

Degartment of Healt & Human Sarviees
OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR

E-mail: tschmoyer@schmoyercpa.com <mailto:tschmoyer@schmoyercpa.com>=20

Visit us on the Web: www.schmoyercpa.com <http://www.schmoyercpa.com/>=20

=20

Confidentiality Notice and IRS Circular 230 Notice
<http://www.schmoyercpa.net/Confidentiality%20Motice.html>=20

=20

JPG attachment type(s) blocked _
This message contained attachments that have been blocked



Linda Malone - (Block) FOI Request Page 2

by Guinevere. Please see your system administrator for
more details

cC: "Kathy Shaw" <Shaw@scdhhs.gov>



SCHHOYER AND COMP Fax: 8032542050 Mar 22 2007 06:450m P001/001

Terry mo_..jcﬁ_. . mHan _B03 -8 -8 \S
From: Temy Schmoyer Jelt Stensend
Sent:.  Thursday, March 22, 2007 7:35 PM
To: stensiand@scDHHS.gov
Ce: Kathy Shaw
Subject: FOI Request
Mr Stendsland

3/22/2007

I would like to respectful request a copy of the 9/30/06 Medicaid cost report for Peachtree
Center. Would you please send me a copy of all work papers submitted with, this report?
Please bill me for copy charges as needed.

Thanks for your assistance with this request.

Terry

RECEIVE

Terry K. Schmoysr, Jr. CPA

Managing Partner | MAR 2 3 2007

, of Heath & Human Services
m SERIEIED PUSE i) MECOUNTANTS OFFICE OF THE DIREGTOR
1330 Lady Strest Suite 507

Columbia, SC 29201

Phone (803) 264-2050

Fax (803) 256-9080
Cell (803) 920-0038

E-maii: schimoyer@schmovyercpa.com

Visit us on the Wab: www.schmoyercpa.com

03/22/2007 06:49PM



State of South Caroling
Bepartment of Health and Human Berfices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Govemor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request #

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages

Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

4 L P PH ©hH &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact should you have any questions.

Signature | Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



State of %EHE Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Hunem Serfrices

Mark Sanford Robert M. Kerr
Governor Director

March 27, 2007

Schmoyer & Company, LLC
Attn: Terry K. Schmoyer

1330 Lady Street, Suite 507
Columbia, South Carolina 29201

Dear Mr. Schmoyer:

In response to your recent Freedom of Information Act request, enclosed you will find
the billing for uqoommm_:m the information you requested to be picked up from our
office.

I hope this information is helpful to you. If you should have any questions, please
contact Gwen Henderscn at (803) 898-1040.

Sincerely,

St v AQ\Q&N

William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

WLW/gph
Enclosures

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box.8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



Mark Sanford
Governor

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT:

The South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services has received and

State of South aroling
Bepartwent of Health and Human Serfrices

Schmoyer & Company, LLC
Attn: Terry K. Schmoyer, Jr. CPA

William L. Wells, CPA
Deputy Director

Cost of Processing FOIA Request # 604

processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing this information is as

follows: |
Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour 1 Hours $10.00
Pages copied at $.10 per page 69 . Pages $ 6.90
Pages faxed at $.20 per page Pages $
Shipping and Handling Costs -
Other costs associated with the FOIA request: $

Total Amount Due SCDHHS: E

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Plgase gontact Gwe

Signature

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297 _
Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

G:Qm_,mo: at (803) 898-1040 should you have any questions.

March 27, 2007

Robert M, Kerr
Director

Date

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



