Haley, Nikki <govhaley@gov.sc.gov>
Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov
11/25/2015 5:25:06 PM

Re: Internal Staff Update

Great. Thank you!
Sent from my iPad

On Nov 25, 2015, at 4:46 PM, Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Updated amount - $437,113
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 24, 2015, at 9:12 AM, Pisarik, Holly <HollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

425,007
Sent from my iPhone

On Nov 24, 2015, at 7:58 AM, Haley, Nikki <govhaley@gov.sc.gov> wrote:

Update on money raised to date for One SC?
Sent from my iPad

On Nov 23, 2015, at 4:59 PM, Schimsa, Rebecca <RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov>
wrote:

Rebecca S. Schimsa

Deputy Legal Counsel

Office of Governor Nikki R. Haley
0: 803-734-6068 | C: 803-429-4561

<November 23, 2015 Internal Staff Update.pdf>
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