Lindsey Smulders <Ilsmulders@wmgllc.com>
Veldran, KatherineKatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov
5/20/2014 3:39:22 PM

RE: jacket invoice

We never received this, will put it thought rush. Should receive payment in a week, 2 latest.
Thanks!

Lindsey Smulders (Welsh) | Wasserman Media Group
P: 416-214-6103, ext.225 | M: 647-882-4211

From: Veldran, Katherine [mailto:KatherineVeldran@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, May 20, 2014 3:00 PM

To: Lindsey Smulders

Subject: FW: jacket invoice

The company is saying it was mailed?

From: Veldran, Katherine

Sent: Tuesday, May 20, 2014 2:58 PM

To: Lindsey Smulders (lwelsh@wmglic.com)
Subject: jacket invoice
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