
Annie, FYI, plz use the assigned a/c# for our MCSAP grant per Donna Strange. 
thx tejal
-----Original Message----- 
From: Strange, Donna 
Sent: Wednesday, January 09, 2002 10:55 AM
To: Bales, Tejal 
Subject: DMV CDL Grant

From: Bales, Tejal
To: Adams, Marcia S. <Adams_MarciaS@scdps.state.sc.us>

Phelps, Annie L. <Phelps_AnnieL@scdps.state.sc.us>
CC: Burgis, David <Burgis_David@scdps.state.sc.us>

Date: 1/9/2002 12:05:18 PM
Subject: FW: DMV CDL Grant

Hi Tejal,

Hope your holidays were good!

I finally got the approval back on the authorization for the $284,450.00 grant for the MCSAP CDL project. I 
have the account numbers and need to get it loaded, so I need the transfers for the breakdowns. Are you still handling this, 
or if not, who would I contact to get the information.

The account numbers are as follows:

The holding account number is 5010 49 9009

The grant account number is 5011 49 6500

The match account number is 1041 49 6500

The process is that I'll load the $284,450 authorization we received into the holding account in the different object codes 
and then transfer it into the grant account. The match will be transferred from whatever account number(s) you have the 
money in now to the new account number.

Let me know if you have any questions or if I need to forward this info to someone else.

Thanks,
Donna
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