Robert Faturechi <Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org>
Schimsa, RebeccaRebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov
Pisarik, HollyHollyPisarik@gov.sc.gov

Adams, ChaneyChaneyAdams@gov.sc.gov
2/3/2016 1:52:54 PM

RE: Cost Letter

Thanks. Please me know if it does not arrive today. Would mean two straight checks have been lost. If so, | will send
certified mail tomorrow morning.

Robert Faturechi

Reporter, ProPublica

Desk: 917-512-0216

Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Schimsa, Rebecca [RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, February 02, 2016 5:25 PM

To: Robert Faturechi

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

| received all of your voicemails and emails and apologize for the delay in getting back to you, but | have been in
committee meetings all afternoon. | just checked our mailbox, and your check has not arrived. | will contact our
postal director right away to check with him as well. As soon as the check arrives, we will let you know.

From: Robert Faturechi [mailto:Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org]
Sent: Tuesday, February 02, 2016 3:57 PM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Hi all, can you please let me know if my check arrived today? If not, it has inexplicably been lost again.

Robert Faturechi

Reporter, ProPublica

Desk: 917-512-0216

Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Robert Faturechi

Sent: Tuesday, February 02, 2016 10:35 AM
To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Hi all - has my check arrived?

Robert Faturechi

Reporter, ProPublica

Desk: 917-512-0216

Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Robert Faturechi

Sent: Monday, February 01, 2016 10:44 AM
To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Thanks so much all. And please let me know if my final check arrives today.
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Robert Faturechi

Reporter, ProPublica

Desk: 917-512-0216

Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org

From: Schimsa, Rebecca [RebeccaSchimsa@gov.sc.gov]
Sent: Monday, February 01, 2016 9:37 AM

To: Robert Faturechi

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Please see attached.

From: Robert Faturechi [mailto:Robert.Faturechi@propublica.org]
Sent: Friday, January 29, 2016 12:50 PM

To: Schimsa, Rebecca

Cc: Pisarik, Holly; Adams, Chaney

Subject: RE: Cost Letter

Hi all. Got the documents. Would you mind sending over an electronic copy of the Nov. 13, 2014 email from Katie Philpott to
Mark Nix from 2:06 pm that has a table in it. The printout got cut off when you printed it.

Robert Faturechi

Reporter, ProPublica

Desk: 917-512-0216

Cell: 213-271-7217
robert.faturechi@propublica.org
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