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(8/18/2009) Jan Polatty - Fwd:

From: Jeff Stensland

To: Polatty, Jan

Date: 8/18/2009 9:01 AM
Subject: Fwd:

Attachments: Fwd:
Can you log the attached and send it to legal?
Jeff Stensland

SC DHHS
(803) 898-2584
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RECEIVE
Tor Jeft Stensiand AUG 18 2009
CC: Deirdra Singleton
Date: 8/18/2009 8:59 AM Department of Hezlth & Human Services
Subfect: et OFFICE OF THE DIRECTOR

Hey, Jeff. Can you log this back to us?

>>> "Prince, William A." <BPrince@nexsenpruet.com> 8/17/2009 4:46 PM >>>

In June 2002 (do not have exact date), DHHS entered into consent order with Cooke and Associates or Cooke Management,
regarding a Medicaid audit appeal as relates to their self insured health benefits program. Would it be possible to get a copy
of that order? If necessary for me to FOIA, could you consider this a formal FOIA request?

William A. Prince
Nexsen Pruet, LLC
1230 Main Street, Suite 700 (29201)

PO Drawer 2426
Columbia, SC 29202
T: mou 540.2012, F: 803.727.1494

[http://www.nexsenpruet.com/L/np.png]<h

[http://www.nexsenpruet.com/L{links_l.png]

CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATION: The information contained in this message may contain legally privileged and
confidential information intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above. If the reader of this message is
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this transmission is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us by telephone or email immediately and
return the original message to us or destroy all printed and electronic copies. Nathing in this transmission is intended to be
an electronic signature nor to constitute an agreement of any kind under applicable law unless otherwise expressly
indicated. Intentional interception or dissemination of electronic mail not belonging to you may violate federal or state law,

IRS CIRCULAR 230 NOTICE: Any federal tax advice contained in this communication (or in any attachment) is not intended
or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue Code or (ii)
promoting, marketing or recommending any transaction or matter addressed in this communication.

***% CONFIDENTIAL COMMUNICATION *** The information contained in this message may contain legally privileged and
confidential information intended only for the use of the individual or entity named above, If the reader of this message is
not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this transmission is
strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify us by telephone or email immediately and
return the original message to us or destroy all printed and electronic copies. Nothing in this transmission is intended to be
an electronic signature nor to constitute an agreement of any kind under applicable law uniess otherwise expressly
indicated. Intentional interception or dissemination of electronic mail not belonging to you may violate federat or state law.

*¥¥ IRS CIRCULAR 230 NOTICE *** Any federal tax advice contained in this communication (or in any attachment) is not
intended or written to be used, and cannot be used, for the purpose of (i) avoiding penalties under the Internal Revenue
Code or (ii} promoting, marketing or recommending any transaction or matter addressed in this communication,
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Can you log the attached and send it to legal?

Jeff Stensland
SC DHHS
(803) 898-2584




State of South Carolina
Bepartment of Hexlth mnd Hromean Serfrices _
Mark Sanford - Emma Forkner

Governor Director

TO:

FROM:

SUBJECT: Cost of Processing FOIA Request # T

“The moﬁﬂdm@:demﬂm|13m|3|ojn__.m|m==&:a.-x:l_.ﬂmzlwmaﬂmﬂzmwl_mdng and
processed your FOIA request. The cost for processing-this information is as

follows:

Staff processing time at $10.00 per hour Hours
Pages copied at $.10 per page Pages
Pages faxed at $.20 per page . Pages

-Shipping and Handling Costs

Other costs associated with the FOIA request:

@® PH P +H B &

Total Amount Due SCDHHS:

Please remit the above amount to the following address:

Bureau of Fiscal Affairs

South Carolina Department of Health and Human Services
Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, South Carolina 29202-8297

Please contact . should you have any questions.

Signature Date:

Finance and Administration
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2503 Fax (803) 255-8235



State of Bouth Carolina
Bepartment of Health and Hunvon Serfices

Mark Sanford Emma Forkner
Governor Director

August 20, 2009

William A. Prince, Esquire
NEXSEN|PRUET

Attorneys and Counselors at Law
1230 Main Street, Suite 700

P. O. Drawer 2426

Columbia, SC 29202

Re: Freedom of Information Act Request
Dear Mr. Prince:

Your recent Freedom of Information Act request was referred to this Office for a response. The
requested information is enclosed.

The cost for retrieving and copying this information is six dollars and 01/100 ($6.01). Please make
your check out to the agency and send it to:

Department of Health and Human Services
Department of Receivables

Post Office Box 8297

Columbia, SC 29202-8297

If there are any questions, please contact me. My direct is 898-2791.

mmbomno_%,

Richard G. Hepfer
Deputy General Counsel

Enclosure
cc: Lynette Wilson, Receivables (w/o enclosures)

Office of General Counsel
P. O. Box 8206 Columbia South Carolina 29202-8206
(803) 898-2795 Fax (803) 255-8210



